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DECRETO DIRETTORIALE N. 2260/2019

OGGETTO: Determina a contrarre tramite affidamento diretto EXTRA MEPA (con preventivo gia
acquisito) — Acquisto di un servizio di pubblicazione di un articolo scientifico dal titolo: ”A Sliding Mode
Virtual Sensor for Wheel Forces Estimation with Accuracy Enchancement via EKF” - IEEE

IL DIRETTORE DI DIPARTIMENTO

- PREMESSO che il Dipartimento di Ingegneria Industriale e dell’Informazione ha necessita di
procedere all’acquisto di un servizio di pubblicazione di un articolo scientifico dal titolo: "A Sliding
Mode Virtual Sensor for Wheel Forces Estimation with Accuracy Enchancement via EKF” per
esigenze di svolgimento dell’attivita di ricerca della Prof.ssa A. Ferrara;

“RICHIAMATO I'art.32 (Fasi delle procedure di affidamento), comma 2, del D.Lgs. n.50/2016 e
s.m.i. (Codice dei contraiti pubblici) ai sensi del quale le stazioni appaltanti, in conformita ai propri
ordinamenti, decretano o determinano a contrarre, individuando gli elementi essenziali del contratto e
i criteri di selezione degli operatori economici e delle offerte;

VISTO Iart.1, comma 449 della Legge n. 296/2006 e s.m.i. ai sensi del quale le istituzioni
universitarie sono tenute ad approvvigionarsi utilizzando le convenzioni quadro di Consip s.p.a.;

- ACCERTATA !’insussistenza di una convenzione Consip attiva per il servizio richiesto;

- VISTO I'art.], comma 450 della Legge n. 296/2006 € s.m.i. ai sensi del quale le Universita per acquisti
di beni e servizi di importo pari o superiore a € 5.000,00 e inferiori alia soglia di rilievo comunitario
sono tenute a fare ricorso al Mercato Elettronico deila Pubblica amministrazione;

- ACCERTATO che il servizio richiesto non & presente nel catalogo MEPA;

- ACQUISITO il preventivo dell’operatore IEEE, che ha offerto per il servizio in oggetto I'importo di
USD 770,00 (IVA esclusa) (Allegato 1: preventivo); ’operatore 1EEE ¢é stato individuato dalla
Prof.ssa A. Ferrara che desidera pubblicare I’articolo scientifico sulla rivista “IEEE Transactions on
Vehicular Technology”;

ACCERTATA la congruita del preventivo proposto con gli attuali costi di mercato e la compatibilita
dell’importo con i vincoli imposti dalla vigente normativa per poter procedere ad affidamento diretto;
RICHIAMATO Vart.36, comma 2, lett.a) del D.Lgs. n.50/2016;



- RICHIAMATO il Regolamento di Atenco per I’Amministrazione, la Finanza e la contabilita, con
particolare riguardo all’art.37 (Poteri di spesa);
- ACCERTATA la sussistenza della copertura finanziaria;

DISPONE

- Di autorizzare, ai sensi dell’art.36, comma 2, lett. a) del D.Lgs. n.50/2016, I’affidamento diretto
all’operatore “IEEE” della fornitura di un servizio di pubblicazione di un articolo scientifico dal titolo:
“A Sliding Mode Virtual Sensor for Wheel Forces Estimation with Accuracy Enchancement via EKF”;
Di nominare la dott.ssa Nicoletta Galli responsabile del procedimento con il supporto della Prof.ssa

A. Ferrara;
- Di far gravare |a relativa spesa quantificata in USD 770,00 (gia comprensivi di [VA) sul progetto
“FERRITEAM2020” del bilancio di previsione dell’ Ateneo relativo all’esercizio finanziario 2019.

Pavia, 26/03/2019

IL DIRETTORE
Prof. Rifc AZZI
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Oggetto: Fwd: Complete your IEEE Article Processing Charge Order [Reference 4: 1903325-000276}
Mittente: Nicoletta Galli <nicoletta.galli@unipv.it>

Data: 26/03/2019 11:21

A: Sonia Corti <sonia,corti@unipv.it>

CC: Enrico Regolin <enrico.regolin@unipv.it>

Per favore Sonia prepara questo ordine su fondi ITEAM Ferrara,
Grazie,
Nicoletta

Dott.ssa Nicoletta Galli

Dipartimento di Ingegneria Industriale
e dell'iInformazione

Universita degli Studi di Pavia

Via Ferrata 5

27100 Pavia

tel. 0332985898 fax 0382422583

e-mail: picoletta. galli@unipv.it

- Forwarded message
Da: Enrco Regolin <enrico.regolin@unipv.it>

Date: [un 25 mar 2019 alle ore 17:25

Subject: Re: Complete your IEEE Artitle Processing Charge Order [Referenca #: 190325-000276}

To: |EEE Support Center <SupportCenter@igee.org»
Cc: Nicoletta Galll <nicoletta.galli@unipyv.it>, <angel-gabriel.alatorre-vazquez@hds.utc fr>

Dear MsMacGeorge,
here is the billing information for the two institutons,

Institution 1 : Dipartimento di Ingegneria Industriale e dell'informazione
Address 1 vla Ferrata 5, 27100, Pavia (Italy)
Contact Name : Nicoletta Galli

email address : segreteria iii@unipv.it / picoletta.galli®@ynipy.it

VAT number 700462870189
Purchzse arder : will be processed In the next few days
amount due  : USS 935.40

instituton 2 : HEUDIASYC, Université de Technologie de Compiegne
Address : BATIMENT PIERRE GUILLAUMAT 2 - CAS 60319, 60203 COMPIEGNE, CEDEX (France)

Contact Name : Brigitte Azzimonti

email address : brigitte, azzimonti@hds.utc i

VAT number ;-

Purchase order : - IS
amount due : LSS 939.400
Kind regards

Enrico Regolin

Il giorro lun 25 mar 2019 alle ore 15:05 IEEE Support Center <SuppartCenter@ieee.org> ha scritto:

Imaaqe

AV W A

26/03/2019 11:36
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Fwd: Complete your IEEE Article Processing Charge Order [Refe...

{_Image Subject: Complete your IEEE Article Processing Charge Order

Reference #: 1890325-000276

Response By Email (fanie) (03/25/2019 1005 AM)

Dear Author,

Please email me the billing author and their billing/shipping address information for the involce. As well as how much each autho
responsible for.

1If you have any questions, please let me know
thank you

Janie MacGenrge

Reprints Department

Auta-Response By (Administrator) (03/25/2019 05:41 AM)
Your Article Processing inquiry has been received and a Reference number has been assigned. You can see thi
the subject line of this email. Please include this Reference number in all communication related to this inquir

Piease note that you may be able to find answers to your questions right on our site - https //suppartcenter.ie
Most inquiries receive a response within 48 business hours.

If you are contacting us about receiving an invoice for your Overlength or Voluntary charges please wait unti
has finished the proof stage. After 3 days you will receive an email that will direct you to our paymens portal t
billing addrass, your charges and you may also make a payment or request an invoice.

If you are contacting us about making a payment for your Overlength or Voluntary charges belaw is addition
information when navigating in the payment portal. The payment options available 1o you have been further

1. H you are paying the article processing charges yourself, you can elect to pay via credit card and a receiy
provided via email. However, if your institution will reimburse you for your payment and the invoice is b
some local/Vat taxes may apply that your institute may not pay. Please check with your institute before ¢
payment.

2. If you are paying the article processing charges yourself, you can elect to pay via wire transfer or check &
will be sent with the invoice and payment details. Again, if your institution will reimburse you for your pi
the invoice is billed to you some local/Vat taxes may apply that your institute may not pay. Please chack
institute before making your payment,

3. if your institution is paying an your behalf, you must choose the *Third party billing” option, and design
payment party and an email will be sent with the invoice and payment details.

4. If your ca-author is paying on your behalf, you must choose “Third party billing” option, and provida the
details and an email will be sent with the Invoice and payment details,

5. You may also have the opportunity to contribute voluntary page charges or order reprinls by adding it te

IEEE Reprints Department
IEEE Operations Center
445 Hoes Lane
Piscataway, N) 0B854

Fax: 732-867-9945

Customer By C5S Email {Enrico Regolin) (03/25/2013 05:41 AM)
Dear Sie/Madam,

we would like to split the payment between the 2 institutions which submitted the paper, but at the "Article P:
Charges” page this option appears to be missing.

101 4 26/03/2019 11:36
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Is there a way to designate 2 separate institutions for the third party billing?

Thanks and regards
Enrico Regolin

----- ----- Forwarded message ---------

Da: IEEE APC Information <poreply@ieeeorg>

Date: lun 25 mar 2019 alle ore 06:57

Subject: Complete your IEEE Article Processing Charge Order

To: <gnrico.regolin@uynipy,it>

-

Dear Enrico Regolin,
Actlan required

You are receiving this emall bacause your recently accepted article, listed below, has artice processing
charges pending. Please read the following payment options carefully and then click on the link below to
pravide payment detalls for your article processing charges.

These are your payment optlans:

1. If you are paying the article processing charges yourself, you can elect to pay via eradit cardg,
wire transler, or check (note: some local/Vat taxes may apply).

2. If your institution Is paying on your behalf, you mugt click on the link below, chogse the "Third
party bllling” option, and designate your payment party.

3. If your co-author Is paying on your behalf, you must click an the link below, choose "Third party
biling" oplian, and provide the payer detaits,

4. For open access charges, additional Institutional payment options may be avalfable to you. The
IEEE has partnerships with many institutions In which the institution pays in advence to cover
articje-processing charges for Its suthors. It completely covers the open access fee for authors
publishing in IEEE open access journals. To determine if your institbtion participates in this
prograrln, select "[EEE Open Access Instintional Account® and review the fist of participating
institutions.

5. You may also have the opportunity to contribute voluntary page charges or order reprnts by
adding It to your order,

ittns./{www.\eep.org/ape: pavinents/authar/regsints-chackout itmi?nid=1_G401NEY

Manuscript 1D/Article 1D/D0T- 10, 1109/TVT.2019.2903598

Article Title- A Sliding Mede Virtual Sensor for Wheet Forces Estimation with Accuracy Enhancement via EKF
1EEE Publication- IEEE Transactions on Veh'cular Techrology

1EEE Order Number- 1-6401NSY

Invaice Amoung- UsS0§1878.8

If you need to contact JEEE for further Information about this message, please e-mall:

IEEE Reprints - at reprints@ere,org
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